
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 5th December 2014 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 788

CATTLE ACT
(CHAPTER 34)

CATTLE (LICENCE FEES)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2014

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 8 of the Cattle Act,
the National Environment Agency, with the approval of the Minister
for the Environment and Water Resources, hereby makes the
following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Cattle (Licence Fees)
(Amendment) Regulations 2014 and shall come into operation on
1 January 2015.

Amendment of regulation 2

2. Regulation 2(1) of the Cattle (Licence Fees) Regulations (Rg 2) is
amended —

(a) by deleting “$33” in sub‑paragraph (a) and substituting
“$66”;

(b) by deleting “$82” in sub‑paragraph (b) and substituting
“$164”; and

(c) by deleting “$150” in sub‑paragraph (c) and substituting
“$300”.

[G.N. No. S 561/2010]

S 788/20141



Made on 2 December 2014.

CHEW GEK KHIM
Chairman,

National Environment Agency,
Singapore.

[MEWR 050/06/102 Vol. 3; NEA/LD/176 Vol. 1; AG/LLRD/SL/34/
2010/1 Vol. 1]

(To be presented to Parliament under section 8(4) of the Cattle Act).

S 788/2014 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of regulation 2

