
	 1	 S 120/2014

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 3rd March 2014 at 5.00 pm.

No. S 120

FEES ACT
(CHAPTER 106)

FEES	
(PRIVATE LOTTERIES) (AMENDMENT)	

ORDER 2014

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 2 of the Fees Act, 
the Minister for Finance hereby makes the following Order:

Citation

1.  This Order may be cited as the Fees (Private Lotteries) 
(Amendment) Order 2014.

Amendment of Schedule

2.  The Schedule to the Fees (Private Lotteries) Order (O 39) is 
amended ––

	 (a)	 by deleting “$5.40” in the second column of item 1 and 
substituting “$5.50”;

	 (b)	 by deleting the words “40 cents” in the second column of 
item 2 and substituting the words “30 cents”; and

	 (c)	 by deleting “$3.20” in the second column of item 3 and 
substituting “$3”.

[G.N. Nos. S 472/2010; S 186/2011]

Made this 27th day of February 2014.

PETER ONG	
Permanent Secretary, 
Ministry of Finance, 

Singapore.

[MF R030.004.0331.V16; AG/LLRD/SL/106/2010/4 Vol. 1]

(To be presented to Parliament under section 3 of the Fees Act).


