1 S 128/2005

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 17th March 2005 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 128

BOUNDARIES AND SURVEY MAPS ACT
(CHAPTER 25)

BOUNDARIES AND SURVEY MAPS (PRESCRIBED FEES)
(AMENDMENT) RULES 2005

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 17(2)(a) of the
Boundaries and Survey Maps Act, the Singapore Land Authority, with
the approval of the Minister for Law, hereby makes the following
Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules may be cited as the Boundaries and Survey Maps
(Prescribed Fees) (Amendment) Rules 2005 and shall come into
operation on 1st April 2005.

Amendment of Schedule

2. The Schedule to the Boundaries and Survey Maps (Prescribed
Fees) Rules (R 2) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$2,060” in item (1)(«) and substituting “$2,1007;
(b) by deleting “$731.30” in item (1)(b) and substituting

“$745.507;

(c) by deleting “$1,565.60” in item (2)(a) and substituting
“$1,596”;

(d) by deleting “$278.10” in item (2)(b) and substituting
“$283.507;

(e) by deleting “$1,339” in item (3) and substituting “$1,365”;
(f) by deleting “$515” in item (6) and substituting “$525”;

(g) by deleting “$123.60” in item (7)(a) and substituting “$126;
(h) by deleting “$61.80” in item (7)(b) and substituting “$63”;

Informal Consolidation — version in force from 1/4/2005



S 128/2005 2

(i) by deleting “$206” in item (8)(a) and substituting “$210”;
(/) by deleting “$20.60” in item (8)(b) and substituting “$21”;

(k) by deleting “$1,751” in items (8)(c) and (12) and substituting
in each case “$1,785”;

()) by deleting “$169.95” in item (9) and substituting “$173.25 ”’;

(m) by deleting “$6.70” and “$3.35” in item (10) and substituting
“$6.80and “$3.40”, respectively;

(n) by deleting “$267.80” in item (11)(a) and substituting
‘6$273’,;

(0) by deleting “$133.90” in item (11)(b) and substituting
“$136.507;

(p) by deleting the words “$226.60 plus $12.40” in item (11)(c)
and substituting the words “$231 plus $12.60”; and

(g) by deleting “$11.35” in item (13) and substituting “$11.55”.

Made this 10th day of March 2005.

LIEW HENG SAN
Chairman,
Singapore Land Authority.

[AG/LEG/SL/25/2000/1 Vol. 1]

Informal Consolidation — version in force from 1/4/2005



	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of Schedule

