1 S 129/2013

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 7th March 2013 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 129

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT
(CHAPTER 276)

ROAD TRAFFIC
(MOTOR VEHICLES, QUOTA SYSTEM)
(AMENDMENT) RULES 2013

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 10A(4) of the Road
Traffic Act, the Minister for Transport hereby makes the following
Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules may be cited as the Road Traffic (Motor Vehicles,
Quota System) (Amendment) Rules 2013 and shall come into
operation on 8th March 2013.

Amendment of rule 20

2. Rule 20(11) of the Road Traffic (Motor Vehicles, Quota System)
Rules (R 31) (referred to in these Rules as the principal Rules) is
amended by deleting “$10” and substituting the words “$10.70
(inclusive of GST)”.

Amendment of rule 24A

3. Rule 24A of the principal Rules is amended —
(a) by deleting “$20” in paragraph (1B) and substituting the
words “$21.40 (inclusive of GST)”; and
(b) by deleting “$10” in paragraph (14) and substituting the
words “$10.70 (inclusive of GST)”.

Miscellaneous amendments

4. The principal Rules are amended by deleting “$20” in the
following provisions and substituting in each case the words “$21.40
(inclusive of GST):



S 129/2013 2

Rules 11(3), 24(10), 24C(6) and 29(1).

[G.N. Nos. S 311/2000; § 431/2000; S 602/2000; S 8/2001;
S 206/2001; S 290/2001; S 337/2001; S 361/2001;

S 482/2001; S 48/2002; S 169/2002; S 383/2002;

S 12/2003; S 426/2003; S 525/2003;S 464/2004;

S 808/2004; S 272/2005; S 124/2006; S 475/20006;

S 137/2008; S 290/2008; S 430/2008; S 357/2010;

S 366/2012; S 378/2012; S 435/2012; S 652/2012]

Made this 5th day of March 2013.

PANG KIN KEONG

Permanent Secretary,

Ministry of Transport,
Singapore.

[LTA/RTA/MVQS/SL/AK/01.13; AG/LLRD/SL/276/2010/18 Vol. 2]

(To be presented to Parliament under section 141(1) of the Road
Traffic Act).



	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of rule 20
	3. Amendment of rule 24A
	4. Miscellaneous amendments

