1 S 130/2020

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 28 February 2020 at 5 pm.

No. S 130

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT
(CHAPTER 276)

ROAD TRAFFIC
(COLLECTION OF TOLL AT
WOODLANDS AND TUAS CHECKPOINTS)
(AMENDMENT) RULES 2020

In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 34D and 140(1) of
the Road Traffic Act, the Minister for Transport makes the following
Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules are the Road Traffic (Collection of Toll at
Woodlands and Tuas Checkpoints) (Amendment) Rules 2020 and
come into operation on 2 March 2020.

Amendment of Schedule

2. The Schedule to the Road Traffic (Collection of Toll at
Woodlands and Tuas Checkpoints) Rules (R 12) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$0.80” in item (1) of Part I and substituting
“$0.60”;

(b) by deleting “$1.00” in item (2) of Part I and substituting
“$0.80”;

(c) by deleting “$0.50” in item (4) of Part I and substituting
“$0.4077;

(d) by deleting “$3.00” in item (1) of Part III and substituting
“$2.50”;

(e) by deleting “$1.50” in item (1) of Part III and substituting
cc$ 1 .20”;

(f) by deleting “$2.50” in item (2) of Part III and substituting
cc$2. 10”;



S 130/2020 2

(2) by deleting “$1.30” in item (2) of Part III and substituting
‘5$ 1 . 1097;

(h) by deleting “$1.90” in item (5) of Part III and substituting
‘C$ 1 '6037;

(i) by deleting “$1.00” in item (5) of Part III and substituting
‘C$O'8037;

(/) by deleting “$3.00” in item (1) of Part IV and substituting
“$2'5097;

(k) by deleting “$1.50” in item (1) of Part IV and substituting
‘C$ 1 '2057;

()) by deleting “$2.50” in item (2) of Part IV and substituting
‘C$2' 10’7;

(m) by deleting “$1.30” in item (2) of Part IV and substituting
‘C$1 . 10’7;

(n) by deleting “$1.90” in item (5) of Part IV and substituting
“$1.60’; and

(0) by deleting “$1.00” in item (5) of Part IV and substituting
“$0.80”.

[G.N. Nos. S 105/2002; S 422/2003; S 418/2005;
S 29/2008; S 407/2010; S 668/2014,; S 409/2017;
§62/2018; S 155/2018; S 45/2019; S 673/2019]

Made on 17 February 2020.

LOH NGAI SENG
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Transport,

Singapore.

[MOT.LT.443.5.003.0.34; AG/LEGIS/SL/276/2020/7 Vol. 1]

(To be presented to Parliament under section 141(1) of the Road
Traffic Act).



	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of Schedule 

