1 S 173/2003

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 1st April 2003 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 173

REGULATION OF IMPORTS AND EXPORTS ACT
(CHAPTER 272A)

REGULATION OF IMPORTS AND EXPORTS (PRESCRIBED
FEES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2003

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Regulation of
Imports and Exports Act, the Minister for Trade and Industry hereby
makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Regulation of Imports and
Exports (Prescribed Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2003 and shall
come into operation on 1st April 2003.

Amendment of Schedule

2. The Schedule to the Regulation of Imports and Exports
(Prescribed Fees) Regulations (Rg 5) is amended —

(a) by deleting the words “(except Import, Export or
Transhipment Permit for trade with West Malaysia)” in the
first column of item 6;

(b) by deleting “$4” in the second column of item 6(a) and
substituting “$0.90”;

(c) by deleting item 7;

(d) by deleting “$10” in the second column of item 10 and
substituting “$10.40”; and

(e) by inserting, at the end thereof, the following Note:

“Note: The fee specified in item 10 is inclusive of the goods and services
tax chargeable under the Goods and Services Tax Act (Cap. 117A)
on the supply of goods or services in respect of which such fee is
payable.”.



S 173/2003 2

Miscellaneous amendments

3. The Regulation of Imports and Exports (Prescribed Fees)
Regulations are amended by deleting the word “Board” wherever it
appears in the following provisions and substituting in each case the
word “Director-General™:

Regulation 2 (including regulation heading) and item 5 of the
Schedule.
[G.N. No. S 593/99]

Made this 28th day of March 2003.

HENG SWEE KEAT
Permanent Secretary,

Ministry of Trade and Industry,
Singapore.

[MTI 66/1-2-16; AG/LEG/SL/272A/2002/1 Vol. 1]

(To be presented to Parliament under section 3(4) of the Regulation
of Imports and Exports Act).



	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of Schedule
	3. Miscellaneous amendments

