
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 16 March 2020 at 5 pm.

No. S 173

ENVIRONMENTAL PUBLIC HEALTH ACT
(CHAPTER 95)

ENVIRONMENTAL PUBLIC HEALTH
(PUBLIC CLEANSING) (AMENDMENT)

REGULATIONS 2020

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 111 of the
Environmental Public Health Act, the National Environment
Agency, with the approval of the Minister for the Environment and
Water Resources, makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations are the Environmental Public Health (Public
Cleansing) (Amendment) Regulations 2020 and come into operation
on 1 April 2020.

Amendment of Second Schedule

2. Paragraph 3 of the Second Schedule to the Environmental Public
Health (Public Cleansing) Regulations (Rg 3) is amended —

(a) by deleting the words “Colex Environmental Pte. Ltd.” and
substituting the words “ALBA W&H Smart City Pte.
Ltd.”;

(b) by deleting “$39.87” in sub-paragraph (2)(a) and
substituting “$40.75”;

(c) by deleting “$107.74” in sub-paragraph (2)(b) and
substituting “$109.51”;

(d) by deleting “$140.06” in sub-paragraph (2)(c) and
substituting “$144.76”;

(e) by deleting “$377.10” in sub-paragraph (2)(d) and
substituting “$425.92”;

S 173/20201



(f) by deleting “$592.59” in sub-paragraph (2)(e) and
substituting “$641.63”; and

(g) by deleting “$39.87” in sub-paragraph (3) and substituting
“$40.75”.

Amendment of Fifth Schedule

3. The Fifth Schedule to the Environmental Public Health (Public
Cleansing) Regulations is amended by deleting the words “COLEX
ENVIRONMENTAL PTE. LTD.” in the Schedule heading and
substituting the words “ALBAW&H SMART CITY PTE. LTD.”.

[G.N. Nos. S 221/2000; S 49/2001; S 176/2001;
S 244/2001; S 287/2001; S 316/2001; S 359/2001;
S 360/2001; S 199/2002; S 377/2004; S 639/2004;
S 589/2005; S 168/2006; S 500/2006; S 712/2006;
S 17/2009; S 405/2009; S 402/2010; S 554/2010;
S 596/2011; S 300/2012; S 165/2013; S 626/2013;
S 367/2014; S 794/2014; S 799/2014; S 162/2015;
S 379/2016; S 620/2016; S 111/2017; S 220/2018;

S 394/2018; S 172/2019]

Made on 9 March 2020.

LEE CHUAN SENG
Chairman,

National Environment Agency,
Singapore.

[NEA/LD/39/8/1 V.1; MEWR C030/01/101; 
AG/LEGIS/SL/95/2020/1 Vol. 1]
(To be presented to Parliament under section 111(4) of the

Environmental Public Health Act).

S 173/2020 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of Second Schedule
	3. Amendment of Fifth Schedule

