
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 31 March 2021 at 5 pm.

No. S 207

HYDROGEN CYANIDE
(FUMIGATION) ACT

(CHAPTER 132)

HYDROGEN CYANIDE
(FUMIGATION) (AMENDMENT)

REGULATIONS 2021

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 2 of the Hydrogen
Cyanide (Fumigation) Act, the Minister for Sustainability and the
Environment makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations are the Hydrogen Cyanide (Fumigation)
(Amendment) Regulations 2021 and come into operation on 1 April
2021.

Amendment of regulation 5

2. Regulation 5 of the Hydrogen Cyanide (Fumigation) Regulations
(Rg 1) (called in these Regulations the principal Regulations) is
amended by deleting “$150” and substituting “$170”.

Amendment of regulation 6

3. Regulation 6 of the principal Regulations is amended by
deleting “$150” and substituting “$170”.

Amendment of regulation 19

4. Regulation 19(1) of the principal Regulations is amended by
deleting “$10” and substituting “$45”.

[G.N. Nos. S 25/92; S 56/93; S 378/96; S 717/2006]

S 207/20211



Made on 23 March 2021.

ALBERT CHUA
Permanent Secretary,

Ministry of Sustainability and
the Environment,

Singapore.

[NEA/LD/176; AG/LEGIS/SL/132/2020/1 Vol. 1]

(To be presented to Parliament under section 2(5) of the Hydrogen
Cyanide (Fumigation) Act).

S 207/2021 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of regulation �5
	3. Amendment of regulation �6
	4. Amendment of regulation �19

