
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 26th May 1999 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 231

ADMINISTRATION OF MUSLIM LAWACT
(CHAPTER 3)

MUSLIM MARRIAGE AND DIVORCE (AMENDMENT)
RULES 1999

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 145 of the
Administration of Muslim Law Act, the President of Singapore
hereby makes the following Rules:

Citation and commencement

1.—(1) These Rules may be cited as the Muslim Marriage and
Divorce (Amendment) Rules 1999 and shall, with the exception of
rule 3 (b), come into operation on 1st June 1999.

(2) Rule 3 (b) of these Rules shall be deemed to have come into
operation on 15th April 1998.

Amendment of rule 32

2. Rule 32 of the Muslim Marriage and Divorce Rules (R 1)
(referred to in these Rules as the principal Rules) is amended —

(a) by deleting paragraph (1) and substituting the following
paragraph:

“(1) The following fees shall be payable to the Kadis
or Naib Kadis:

(a) for registering a marriage
(inclusive of the issue of 2
copies of a certificate of
marriage)

$37

(b) for registering a divorce
(inclusive of the issue of 2
copies of a certificate of
divorce)

$47

S 231/19991



(c) for registering a revocation
of divorce (inclusive of the
issue of 2 copies of a
certificate of revocation of
divorce)

$39

(d) for preparing a certified
copy of the grounds for
the refusal to register a
marriage, divorce or
revocation of divorce
under section 104 (3) of
the Act

$37

(e) for the issue of a summons
under section 142 of the
Act

$19

(f) for preparing a certified
copy of the notes of
evidence of any
proceedings before a Kadi
or Naib Kadi (per page)

$27.

”; and

(b) by deleting “$22” in the 5th line of paragraph (3) and
substituting “$24”.

Amendment of rule 33

3. Rule 33 of the principal Rules is amended —

(a) by deleting “$17” in paragraph (1) (a) and substituting
“$19”;

(b) by deleting “$14” in paragraph (2) (a) and substituting
“$17”; and

(c) by deleting “$17” in paragraph (2) (a) and substituting
“$19”.

S 231/1999 2



Amendment of rule 34

4. Rule 34 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting “$25” in
paragraph (f) and substituting “$26”.

[G.N. Nos. S 53/93; S 296/94; S 116/95; S 88/97; S 452/97;
S 456/97; S 197/98]

Made this 20th day of May 1999.

By Command,

ONG KOK MIN
Secretary to the Cabinet,

Singapore.

[MCD 43-20-01 V18; Sh/Ct 13-01-01B; AG/LEG/SL/3/97/1 Vol. 1]

S 231/19993


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of rule 32
	3. Amendment of rule 33
	4. Amendment of rule 34

