
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 14 April 2021 at 5 pm.

No. S 261

MASSAGE ESTABLISHMENTS ACT 2017
(ACT 45 OF 2017)

MASSAGE ESTABLISHMENTS
(AMENDMENT) RULES 2021

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 35(1) of the Massage
Establishments Act 2017, the Minister for Home Affairs makes the
following Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules are the Massage Establishments (Amendment)
Rules 2021 and come into operation on 15 April 2021.

Amendment of rule 4

2. Rule 4(2) of the Massage Establishments Rules 2018 (G.N. No.
S 96/2018) (called in these Rules the principal Rules) is amended by
deleting “$11” and substituting “$15”.

Amendment of rule 7

3. Rule 7(4) of the principal Rules is amended by deleting “$22”
and substituting “$40”.

Deletion and substitution of rule 9

4. Rule 9 of the principal Rules is deleted and the following rule
substituted therefor:

“Application fee for approval to employ individual

9. For the purposes of section 14(2)(b) of the Act, the
prescribed application fee is —

(a) $34 if the application is made before 1 April 2022; or

(b) $50 if the application is made on or after 1 April
2022.”.

S 261/20211



Amendment of rule 11

5. Rule 11(4) of the principal Rules is amended by deleting “$22”
and substituting “$35”.

[G.N. Nos. S 855/2019; S 204/2020]

Made on 31 March 2021.

PANG KIN KEONG
Permanent Secretary,

Ministry of Home Affairs,
Singapore.

[MHA 112/2/0104; AG/LEGIS/SL/173/2020/2 Vol. 1]

S 261/2021 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of rule �4
	3. Amendment of rule �7
	4. Deletion and substitution of rule �9
	5. Amendment of rule �11 

