
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 5 April 2019 at 5 pm.

No. S 296

EMPLOYMENT ACT
(CHAPTER 91)

EMPLOYMENT (ADMINISTRATIVE PENALTIES)
(AMENDMENT NO. 2) REGULATIONS 2019

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 139 of the
Employment Act, the Minister for Manpower makes the following
Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations are the Employment (Administrative
Penalties) (Amendment No. 2) Regulations 2019 and come into
operation on 5 April 2019.

Amendment of Schedule

2. The Schedule to the Employment (Administrative Penalties)
Regulations 2016 (G.N. No. S 149/2016) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$2,000” in the second column of item 8 and
substituting “$1,000”;

(b) by deleting “$1,000” in the third column of item 9 and
substituting “$2,000”; and

(c) by deleting “$1,000” in the third column of item 10 and
substituting “$2,000”.

[G.N. No. S 202/2019]

S 296/20191



Made on 5 April 2019.

AUBECK KAM
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Manpower,

Singapore.

[WPSD/ESLR/20190328; AG/LEGIS/SL/91/2015/6 Vol. 1]

(To be presented to Parliament under section 139(3) of the
Employment Act).

S 296/2019 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of Schedule

