1 S 428/2014

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 27th June 2014 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 428

CENTRAL PROVIDENT FUND ACT
(CHAPTER 36)

CENTRAL PROVIDENT FUND
(PRESCRIBED AMOUNT FOR MEDISAVE ACCOUNT)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2014

In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 16 and 77(1) of the
Central Provident Fund Act, the Minister for Manpower, after
consulting with the Central Provident Fund Board, hereby makes
the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Central Provident Fund
(Prescribed Amount for Medisave Account) (Amendment)
Regulations 2014 and shall come into operation on 1st July 2014.

Amendment of regulation 2

2. Regulation 2 of the Central Provident Fund (Prescribed Amount
for Medisave Account) Regulations (Rg 22) is amended by deleting
“$40,500” and substituting “$43,500”.

Amendment of regulation 3

3. Regulation 3 of the Central Provident Fund (Prescribed Amount
for Medisave Account) Regulations is amended by deleting
“$12,150” in paragraphs (1) and (3) and substituting in each case
“$13,050”.

[G.N. Nos. S 276/2010; S 769/2010; S 273/2011;
§265/2012; S 344/2013]



S 428/2014 2

Made this 26th day of June 2014.

LOH KHUM YEAN
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Manpower,
Singapore.

[MMS 10.1/82 V 14; AG/LLRD/SL/36/2010/11 Vol. 1]

(To be presented to Parliament under section 78(2) of the Central
Provident Fund Act).



	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of regulation 2
	3. Amendment of regulation 3

