
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 1st July 2014 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 453

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT
(CHAPTER 276)

ROAD TRAFFIC
(INTERNATIONAL CIRCULATION)

(AMENDMENT) RULES 2014

In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 25 and 140 of the
Road Traffic Act, the Minister for Transport hereby makes the
following Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules may be cited as the Road Traffic (International
Circulation) (Amendment) Rules 2014 and shall come into operation
on 1st August 2014.

Amendment of rule 20E

2. Rule 20E(1) of the Road Traffic (International Circulation) Rules
(R 7) is amended by deleting “$20” in sub‑paragraph (b) and
substituting “$35”.

Amendment of Fourth Schedule

3. Item (1) of the Fourth Schedule to the Road Traffic (International
Circulation) Rules is amended by deleting “$10” and substituting
“$40”.

[G.N. Nos. S 421/2003; S 673/2004; S 714/2004;
S 786/2004; S 64/2005; S 321/2005]

S 453/20141



Made this 27th day of June 2014.

PANG KIN KEONG
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Transport,

Singapore.

[LTA/RTA/NN/MR/RT_IC Rules 2014; AG/LLRD/SL/276/2010/77
Vol. 1]

(To be presented to Parliament under section 141(1) of the Road
Traffic Act).

S 453/2014 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of rule 20E
	3. Amendment of Fourth Schedule

