
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 31st July 2006 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 457

FISHERIES ACT
(CHAPTER 111)

FISHERIES
(FISH CULTURE FARMS) (AMENDMENT)

RULES 2006

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 27 of the Fisheries
Act, the Minister for National Development hereby makes the
following Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules may be cited as the Fisheries (Fish Culture Farms)
(Amendment) Rules 2006 and shall come into operation on
1st August 2006.

Amendment of rule 5

2. Rule 5 of the Fisheries (Fish Culture Farms) Rules (R 7) is
amended by deleting “$770” and substituting “$850”.

Amendment of Schedule

3. Paragraph 8 of the Schedule to the Fisheries (Fish Culture Farms)
Rules is amended by deleting “$670” and substituting “$710”.

[G.N. Nos. S 274/92; S 239/93; S 347/94; S 158/97; S
154/98; S 101/2000]

S 457/20061



Made this 17th day of July 2006.

TAN TEE HOW
Permanent Secretary,

Ministry of National Development,
Singapore.

[Infra/AVA/Finance/0070; AG/LEG/SL/111/2005/1 Vol. 1]

S 457/2006 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of rule 5
	3. Amendment of Schedule

