1 S 465/2011

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 15th August 2011 at 5.00 pm.

No. S 465

CASINO CONTROL ACT
(CHAPTER 33A)

CASINO CONTROL
(LICENSING OF SPECIAL EMPLOYEES) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2011

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 200 of the Casino
Control Act, the Casino Regulatory Authority of Singapore, with the
approval of the Minister for Home Affairs, hereby makes the following
Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Casino Control (Licensing
of Special Employees) (Amendment) Regulations 2011 and shall come
into operation on 1st September 2011.

Amendment of Second Schedule
2. The Second Schedule to the Casino Control (Licensing of Special
Employees) Regulations 2009 (G.N. No. S 415/2009) is amended —
(a) by deleting “$260” in item 1(c¢) and substituting “$270’;
(b) by deleting “$260” in item 1(d) and substituting “$270’;
(c) by deleting “$20” in item 3(c) and substituting “$30’’; and
(d) by deleting “$20” in item 3(d) and substituting “$30”".

Made this 10th day of August 2011.

RICHARD MAGNUS
Chairman,
Casino Regulatory Authority of Singapore.

[CRC1/65/12C Vol. 1; AG/LLRD/SL/33A/2010/17 Vol. 1]



