1 S 562/2014

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 29th August 2014 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 562

BOUNDARIES AND SURVEY MAPS ACT
(CHAPTER 25)

BOUNDARIES AND SURVEY MAPS
(PRESCRIBED FEES) (AMENDMENT)
RULES 2014

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 17(2)(a) of the
Boundaries and Survey Maps Act, the Singapore Land Authority, with
the approval of the Minister for Law, hereby makes the following
Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules may be cited as the Boundaries and Survey Maps
(Prescribed Fees) (Amendment) Rules 2014 and shall come into
operation on 1 December 2014.

Amendment of Schedule

2. The Schedule to the Boundaries and Survey Maps (Prescribed
Fees) Rules (R 2) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$173.25” in item (2)(a) and substituting “$190”’;
(b) by deleting “$118” in item (2)(b) and substituting “$130”; and

(¢) by deleting “$150” in item (3)(a) and substituting “$165”.
[G.N. Nos. S 104/2009; S 615/2011]



S 562/2014 2

Made on 27 August 2014.

LIM SIM SENG
Chairman,
Singapore Land Authority.

[SLA/CF/6.5.69; AG/LLRD/SL/25/2010/2 Vol. 1]



	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of Schedule

