
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 6 December 2017 at 5 pm.

No. S 701

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT
(CHAPTER 276)

ROAD TRAFFIC
(REGISTRATION OF POWER-ASSISTED
BICYCLES) (AMENDMENT) RULES 2017

In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 34(1) and 140 of the
Road Traffic Act, the Minister for Transport makes the following
Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules are the Road Traffic (Registration of Power-Assisted
Bicycles) (Amendment) Rules 2017 and come into operation on
20 December 2017.

Amendment of First Schedule

2. The First Schedule to the Road Traffic (Registration of
Power‑Assisted Bicycles) Rules 2017 (G.N. No. S 451/2017) is
amended —

(a) by deleting “$21.40” in item 3 and substituting “$32.10”;

(b) by deleting “$5.35” in item 4 and substituting “$7.49”;

(c) by deleting “$10.70” in item 5 and substituting “$12.84”;
and

(d) by deleting “$21.40” in item 6 and substituting “$35.31”.

S 701/20171



Made on 5 December 2017.

LOH NGAI SENG
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Transport,

Singapore.

[LTA/L18.029.002.KT/TS; AG/LEGIS/SL/276/2015/52 Vol. 1]

(To be presented to Parliament under section 141(1) of the Road
Traffic Act).

S 701/2017 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of First Schedule

