
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 29th December 2016 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 706

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT
(CHAPTER 276)

ROAD TRAFFIC
(TAXI SERVICE OPERATOR LICENCE)
(AMENDMENT NO. 2) RULES 2016

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 111J of the Road
Traffic Act, the Land Transport Authority of Singapore, with the
approval of the Minister for Transport, makes the following Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules are the Road Traffic (Taxi Service Operator Licence)
(Amendment No. 2) Rules 2016 and come into operation on
30 December 2016.

Amendment of rule 3

2. Rule 3(1) of the Road Traffic (Taxi Service Operator Licence)
Rules (R 41) is amended by deleting “$200” and substituting “$500”.

Amendment of rule 5

3. Rule 5(2) of the Road Traffic (Taxi Service Operator Licence)
Rules is amended by deleting “0.1%” and substituting “0.2%”.

[G.N. No. S 183/2016]

S 706/20161



Made on 23 December 2016.

RICHARD LIM CHERNG YIH
Deputy Chairman,

Land Transport Authority of
Singapore.

[LTA/18.029.002 NN/NJ(TSOL); AG/LEGIS/SL/276/2015/31
Vol. 1]

(To be presented to Parliament under section 141(1) of the Road
Traffic Act).

S 706/2016 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of rule 3
	3. Amendment of rule 5

