
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 15 December 2017 at 5 pm.

No. S 724

CENTRAL PROVIDENT FUND ACT
(CHAPTER 36)

CENTRAL PROVIDENT FUND
(VOLUNTARY CONTRIBUTIONS)

(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2017

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 77(1) of the Central
Provident Fund Act, the Minister for Manpower, after consulting with
the Central Provident Fund Board, makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations are the Central Provident Fund (Voluntary
Contributions) (Amendment) Regulations 2017 and come into
operation on 1 January 2018.

Amendment of regulation 3

2. Regulation 3(1) of the Central Provident Fund (Voluntary
Contributions) Regulations 2011 (G.N. No. S 731/2011) is
amended by deleting “$1,500” wherever it appears in
sub‑paragraph (d)(i) and substituting in each case “$2,730”.

Amendment of regulation 4

3. Regulation 4(2) of the Central Provident Fund (Voluntary
Contributions) Regulations 2011 is amended by deleting “$1,500”
and substituting “$2,730”.

[G.N. Nos. S 858/2014; S 749/2015; S 189/2016]

S 724/20171



Made on 8 December 2017.

NG HOW YUE
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Manpower,

Singapore.

[Plg&Pol/CPFPol/Legis/CPFSL/2017; 
AG/LEGIS/SL/36/2015/23 Vol. 1]
(To be presented to Parliament under section 78(2) of the Central

Provident Fund Act).

S 724/2017 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of regulation �3
	3. Amendment of regulation �4

