
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 27 December 2017 at 5 pm.

No. S 759

GOVERNMENT PROCUREMENT ACT
(CHAPTER 120)

GOVERNMENT PROCUREMENT (APPLICATION)
(AMENDMENT) ORDER 2017

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 4 of the Government
Procurement Act, theMinister for Finance makes the following Order:

Citation and commencement

1. This Order is the Government Procurement (Application)
(Amendment) Order 2017 and comes into operation on 1 January
2018.

Amendment of paragraph 4

2. Paragraph 4 of the Government Procurement (Application) Order
(O 1) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$135,149” in sub‑paragraph (2) and
substituting “$135,511”;

(b) by deleting “$767,800” in sub‑paragraph (2A) and
substituting “$769,240”; and

(c) by deleting “$9,597,500” in sub‑paragraph (2B) and
substituting “$9,615,500”.

[G.N. Nos. S 695/2004; S 144/2006; S 736/2010;
S 260/2012; S 553/2012; S 792/2013; S 270/2014;
S 464/2014; S 533/2015; S 790/2015; S 270/2016;

S 356/2016; S 517/2016]

S 759/20171



Made on 22 December 2017.

YONG YING-I
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Finance,

Singapore.

[E003.009.2730.V3; AG/LEGIS/SL/120/2015/2 Vol. 2]

S 759/2017 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of paragraph �4

