
	 1	 S 872/2014

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 30th December 2014 at 5.00 pm.

No. S 872

CENTRAL	PROVIDENT	FUND	ACT
(CHAPTER	36)

CENTRAL	PROVIDENT	FUND	(MEDISAVE	ACCOUNT	
WITHDRAWALS)	 (AMENDMENT	NO.	2)	 	

REGULATIONS	2014

In	 exercise	 of	 the	 powers	 conferred	 by	 section	 77(1)(j)	 of	 the	
Central	 Provident	 Fund	 Act,	 the	 Minister	 for	 Manpower,	 after	
consulting	 with	 the	 Central	 Provident	 Fund	 Board,	 hereby	 makes	
the	 following	 Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1.	 These	Regulations	may	be	cited	as	the	Central	Provident	Fund	
(Medisave	Account	Withdrawals)	 (Amendment	No.	2)	Regulations	
2014	and	 shall	 come	 into	operation	on	1  January	2015.

Amendment of regulation 2

2.	 Regulation	 2(1)	 of	 the	 Central	 Provident	 Fund	 (Medisave	
Account	 Withdrawals)	 Regulations	 (Rg	 17)	 (referred	 to	 in	 these	
Regulations	 as	 the	principal	 Regulations)	 is	 amended	––

	 (a)	 by	inserting,	immediately	after	the	definition	of	“member”,	
the	 following	 definition:

“			“non-qualifying	medical	treatment”	means	any	medical	
treatment	for	which	no	withdrawal	from	a	medisave	
account	 may	 be	 made	 under	 these	 Regulations;”;	
and	

	 (b)	 by	inserting,	immediately	after	the	definition	of	“out-patient”,	
the	 following	 definition:

“			“out-patient	 scan”	means	any	 scan	which	––
	 (a)	 is	 performed	 on	 an	 out-patient	 for	 the	

purpose	 of	 ––
	 (i)	 providing	 diagnostic	 imaging	 to	

investigate	 any	 medical	 condition	 of	 the	
out-patient;	or



S 872/2014	 2

	 (ii)	 providing	 clinical	 information	 for	
any	 non-qualifying	 medical	 treatment	
received	by	 the	out-patient;	 and

	 (b)	 may	 include	 magnetic	 resonance	 imaging	
(MRI),	 computerised	 tomography	 (CT)	
scans,	 positron	 emission	 tomography	 (PET)	
scans,	ultrasound	imaging	and	mammograms,	
but	does	not	 include	 the	 following:
	 (i)	 any	 cancer	 scan	 or	 diagnostic	 test	

defined	 in	 regulation	13(7);	
	 (ii)	 any	scan	for	health	screening	purposes;
	 (iii)	 any	scan	not	instructed	by	an	approved	

medical	practitioner;
	 (iv)	 any	 scan	 performed	 at	 the	 emergency	

department	 of	 an	 approved	 medical	
institution;”.

Amendment of regulation 3

3.	 Regulation	 3	 of	 the	 principal	 Regulations	 is	 amended	 by	
inserting,	immediately	after	paragraph	(8),	the	following	paragraph:

“(9)	 For	 the	 purposes	 of	 this	 regulation	 and	 regulations	 4,	
13(1),	23	and	25,	unless	the	context	otherwise	requires,	“medical	
treatment”	 includes	an	out-patient	 scan.”.

Amendment of regulation 4

4.	 Regulation	 4(1)	 of	 the	 principal	 Regulations	 is	 amended	 by	
inserting,	 immediately	 after	 “13,”,	 “13A,”.

Amendment of regulation 9

5.	 Regulation	 9(1)	 of	 the	 principal	 Regulations	 is	 amended	 by	
deleting	“$160”	 in	sub-paragraph	(b)	and	substituting	“$200”.

Amendment of regulation 9A

6.	 Regulation	 9A	of	 the	principal	Regulations	 is	 amended	––
	 (a)	 by	 deleting	 “$1,500”	 in	 paragraph	 (1)(a)	 and	 substituting	

“$2,500”;	 and



	 3	 S 872/2014

	 (b)	 by	inserting,	immediately	after	paragraph	(1),	the	following	
paragraph:

“(1A)	 The	 limit	 referred	 to	 in	 paragraph	 (1)(a)	 does	
not	 apply	 if	 the	 withdrawal	 from	 a	 member’s	 medisave	
account	 is	 for	 the	 payment	 of	 any	 medical	 treatment	
(other	 than	 any	 approved	 vaccination)	 received	 by	 the	
member	 at	 home	 as	 an	 out-patient	 from	 an	 approved	
palliative	care	provider	in	respect	of	such	terminal	illness	
as	may	be	approved	 by	 the	Minister	 for	Health.”.

Amendment of regulation 13

7.	 Regulation	 13	of	 the	principal	Regulations	 is	 amended	––
	 (a)	 by	 inserting,	 immediately	 after	 “9A,”	 in	 paragraph  (1),	

“13A,”;	
	 (b)	 by	 deleting	 the	 word	 “outpatient”	 in	 paragraph  (6)	 and	

substituting	 the	word	“out-patient”;	 and
	 (c)	 by	 deleting	 the	 regulation	 heading	 and	 substituting	 the	

following	 regulation	 heading:
“Out-patient medical treatment and approved medical 
treatment, etc.”.

New regulation 13A

8.	 The	 principal	 Regulations	 are	 amended	 by	 inserting,	
immediately	after	 regulation	 13,	 the	 following	 regulation:

“Out-patient scans

13A.––(1)	 Where,	 on	 or	 after	 1	 January	 2015,	 a	 member	 or	
his	 dependant	 has	 undergone	 any	 out-patient	 scan	 approved	
by	 the	 Minister	 for	 Health	 for	 the	 purposes	 of	 this	 regulation,	
the	 amount	 that	 may	 be	 withdrawn	 by	 the	 member	 for	 the	
payment	 of	 such	 scan	 must	 not	 exceed	 $300	 per	 year	 per	
patient	 or	 the	 total	 credit	 balance	 in	 the	 member’s	 medisave	
account,	whichever	 is	 the	 lower.

(2)	 Any	withdrawal	by	a	member	under	this	regulation	shall	
be	 subject	 to	 such	 terms	 and	 conditions	 as	 the	 Minister	 for	
Health	may	 impose.”.



S 872/2014	 4

Amendment of regulation 24

9.	 Regulation	 24(1)	of	 the	principal	Regulations	 is	 amended	––
	 (a)	 by	deleting	 the	word	“or”	at	 the	end	of	 sub-paragraph	 (i);	

and
	 (b)	 by	deleting	the	comma	at	the	end	of	sub-paragraph	(j)	and	

substituting	 the	 word	 “;	 or”,	 and	 by	 inserting	 immediately	
thereafter	 the	 following	 sub-paragraph:

	 “(k)	 any	out-patient	 scan	under	 regulation	13A,”.
[G.N. Nos. S 224/2007; S 527/2007; S 731/2007; S 149/2008; S 456/2008;  

S 682/2008; S 86/2009; S 239/2009; S 523/2009; S 659/2009;  
S 88/2010; S 118/2010; S 289/2010; S 548/2010; S 367/2011;  

S 725/2011; S 107/2013; S 482/2013; S 623/2013; S 427/2014]

Made	on	29	December	2014.

CHAN	HENG	KEE	
Permanent Secretary, 

Ministry of Manpower, 
Singapore.

[MMS	10.1/82	V14;	AG/LLRD/SL/36/2010/1	Vol.	 2]

(To	be	presented	to	Parliament	under	section	78(2)	of	the	Central	
Provident	 Fund	 Act).


