
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 15 February 2019 at 5 pm.

No. S 88

MISUSE OF DRUGS ACT
(CHAPTER 185)

MISUSE OF DRUGS (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2019

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 58(1) of the Misuse
of Drugs Act, the Minister for Home Affairs makes the following
Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations are the Misuse of Drugs (Amendment)
Regulations 2019 and come into operation on 2 April 2019.

Amendment of Seventh Schedule

2. The Seventh Schedule to the Misuse of Drugs Regulations (Rg 1)
is amended —

(a) by deleting “$500” in the second column of items 1 and 2
and substituting in each case “$515”;

(b) by deleting “$100” in the second column of items 3 and 4
and substituting in each case “$103”;

(c) by deleting “$200” in the second column of item 5(a) and
substituting “$206”; and

(d) by deleting “$50” in the second column of item 5(b) and
substituting “$52”.

[G.N. Nos. S 390/99; S 231/2000; S 436/2000; S 140/2001;
S 492/2001; S 506/2005; S 490/2006; S 108/2007;
S 525/2010; S 684/2010; S 270/2013; S 322/2014;
S 571/2014; S 253/2015; S 199/2016; S 193/2017;

S 234/2018; S 588/2018]

S 88/20191



Made on 12 February 2019.

PANG KIN KEONG
Permanent Secretary,

Ministry of Home Affairs,
Singapore.

[MHA 112/2/0049 TF-12; AG/LEGIS/SL/185/2015/1 Vol. 3]

S 88/2019 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of Seventh Schedule

