
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 31st December 2014 at 1:00 pm.

No. S 889

SECURITIES AND FUTURES ACT
(CHAPTER 289)

SECURITIES AND FUTURES
(OFFERS OF INVESTMENTS)
(BUSINESS TRUSTS) (NO. 2)

(AMENDMENT NO. 2) REGULATIONS 2014

In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 282C, 282F, 282I,
282L, 282V, 282W, 282Z, 282ZB, 282ZC, 318, 337, 339 and 341 of
the Securities and Futures Act, the Monetary Authority of Singapore
hereby makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Securities and Futures
(Offers of Investments) (Business Trusts) (No. 2) (Amendment No. 2)
Regulations 2014 and shall come into operation on 2 January 2015.

Amendment of item 1 of First Schedule

2. Item 1 of the First Schedule to the Securities and Futures (Offers
of Investments) (Business Trusts) (No. 2) Regulations 2005
(G.N. No. S 612/2005) (referred to in these Regulations as the First
Schedule) is amended by deleting “$1,200” in the last column and
substituting “$2,000”.

Deletion and substitution of item 3 of First Schedule

3. Item 3 of the First Schedule is deleted and the following item
substituted therefor:

“ 3. Section 282C(13) For lodgment of any amendment
to —

(a) a prospectus; or $1,000

(b) a profile statement $600
”.

S 889/20141



Amendment of item 4 of First Schedule

4. Item 4 of the First Schedule is amended by deleting “$1,200” in
the last column and substituting “$2,000”.

[G.N. Nos. S 468/2012; S 12/2014]

Made on 30 December 2014.

RAVI MENON
Managing Director,

Monetary Authority of Singapore.

[CMD-CFD019/2005; AG/LLRD/SL/289/2010/18 Vol. 1]

S 889/2014 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of item 1 of First Schedule
	3. Deletion and substitution of item 3 of First Schedule
	4. Amendment of item 4 of First Schedule

