1 S 90/2019

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 15 February 2019 at 5 pm.

No. S 90

HEALTH PRODUCTS ACT
(CHAPTER 122D)

HEALTH PRODUCTS (MEDICAL DEVICES)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2019

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 71 of the Health
Products Act, the Health Sciences Authority, with the approval of the
Minister for Health, makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations are the Health Products (Medical Devices)
(Amendment) Regulations 2019 and come into operation on 2 April
2019.

Amendment of Fourth Schedule

2. Part 1 of the Fourth Schedule to the Health Products (Medical
Devices) Regulations 2010 (G.N. No. S 436/2010) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$500” in item 1(b), (c¢) and (d) and substituting
in each case “$515”;

(b) by deleting “$1,800” in item 2(b)(i) and substituting
“$1,850”;

(c) by deleting “$900” in item 2(b)(ii) and (iii) and substituting
in each case “$925”;

(d) by deleting “$3,500” in item 2(b)(iv) and (c)(i) and
substituting in each case “$3,605”;

(e) by deleting “$5,700” in item 2(c)(ii) and substituting
“$5,870”;

(f) by deleting “$3,000” in item 2(c)(iii) and (ca) and
substituting in each case “$3,090”;



S 90/2019 2

(g) by deleting “$5,700” in item 2(d)(i) and substituting
‘C$5’870’9;

(h) by deleting “$11,400” in item 2(d)(ii) and substituting
“$11,6007;

(i) by deleting “$5,400” in item 2(d)(iii) and substituting
‘C$5’560’9;

(/) by deleting “$10,000” in item 2(e)(i) and substituting
“$10,2007;

(k) by deleting $75,000” in item 2(e)(ii) and substituting
“$75,2007;

() by deleting “$35” in item 3(b) and substituting “$36”;
(m) by deleting “$60” in item 3(c) and substituting “$62”;
(n) by deleting “$120” in item 3(d) and substituting “$124”;

(0) by deleting “$500” in item 4(b) and (c)(i) and substituting
in each case “$515”;

(p) by deleting “$1,700” in item 4(c)(ii) and substituting
cc$1’75033;

(g) by deleting “$2,800” in item 4(c)(iii) and substituting
¢6$2’880’3;

(r) by deleting “$1,000” in item 6(a), (b) and (c¢) and
substituting in each case “$1,030”;

(s) bydeleting “$150” in item 7(a), (b) and (c¢) and substituting
in each case “$155”;

(t) by deleting “$800” in item 8 and substituting “$820”;
(u) by deleting “$350” in item 9(a) and substituting “$360”;
(v) by deleting “$150” in item 9(b) and substituting “$155”;

(w) by deleting “$250” in items 9(c) and 10 and substituting in
each case “$258”; and



3 S 90/2019

(x) by deleting “$50” in items 11 and 12(a) and (b) and
substituting in each case “$52”.

[G.N. Nos. S 542/2011; S 140/2012; § 169/2012;
§370/2012; S 426/2012; S 646/2012; S 334/2016;
S 538/2016; S 444/2017; S 318/2018; S 319/2018]

Made on 13 February 2019.

KANDIAH SATKUNANANTHAM
Chairman,
Health Sciences Authority,
Singapore.

[HSA/Legal/2019:09; AG/LEGIS/SL/122D/2015/3 Vol. 4]



	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of Fourth Schedule

