
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 15 February 2019 at 5 pm.

No. S 94

HEALTH PRODUCTS ACT
(CHAPTER 122D)

HEALTH PRODUCTS (THERAPEUTIC PRODUCTS
AS CLINICAL RESEARCH MATERIALS)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2019

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 71 of the Health
Products Act, the Health Sciences Authority, with the approval of the
Minister for Health, makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations are the Health Products (Therapeutic Products
as Clinical Research Materials) (Amendment) Regulations 2019 and
come into operation on 2 April 2019.

Amendment of First Schedule

2. The First Schedule to the Health Products (Therapeutic Products
as Clinical Research Materials) Regulations 2016
(G.N. No. S 332/2016) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$100” in item 1 and substituting “$103”;

(b) by deleting “$6,000” in item 2(a) and substituting
“$6,180”;

(c) by deleting “$200” in item 2(b) and (d) and substituting in
each case “$206”; and

(d) by deleting “$3,500” in item 2(c) and substituting
“$3,605”.

S 94/20191



Made on 13 February 2019.

KANDIAH SATKUNANANTHAM
Chairman,

Health Sciences Authority,
Singapore.

[HSA/Legal/2019:13; AG/LEGIS/SL/122D/2015/2 Vol. 1]

S 94/2019 2


	1. Citation and commencement
	2. Amendment of First Schedule

